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INTRODUCTION
The biopsychosocial approach, which is also central to pedi-
atric practice and is still very relevant, is encapsulated in the 
multiaxial classification approach, which has been developed 
over several decades in child and adolescent psychiatry. The 
introduction of clinical issues, analysis, a multidisciplinary 
and comprehensive approach to dealing with evaluation and 
executives, and the comparable utilization of pharmacologi-
cal specialists and psychosocial interventions are all areas in 
which there is significant overlap between formative conduct 
pediatrics and young child and juvenile emotional wellness. 
There are numerous ways that pediatricians can benefit from 
the multiaxial classification, both in clinical practice and for ed-
ucational purposes. In a structured and consistent format, it 
encourages a more comprehensive diagnostic representation 
and may improve communication between the two fields. Case 
description, formulation, timeline and interventions, training, 
and teaching are just a few of the many practical applications 
that the multiaxial biopsychosocial framework can be applied 
to.

DESCRIPTION
In child and adolescent psychiatry, classification systems and 
the practical implications they have have grown in importance. 
A multiaxial classification system for children and the adoles-
cents presenting to mental health services is described in this 
paper, along with its development and practical applications. 
Worked examples that show how the complicated many pre-
sentations are included. Complex data are concisely ordered 
by a multiaxial system, which encapsulates the broader bio-
psychosocial aspects of the presenting child or adolescent. 
This strategy can help with the case reviews, formulation, and 
teaching as well as concise communication with other treating 

clinicians.

Because they can provide tactile information necessary to 
perform the various tasks, tactile sensors for robotic applica-
tions boost the performance of the robotic end-effectors. Par-
ticularly, tactile sensors that can detect slip and measure the 
multi-axial force can help the end-effectors grasp a variety of 
the objects in an unstructured environment. For robotic appli-
cations, we propose BaroTac, which uses a barometric pressure 
sensor chip to the measure three axial forces and detect slip. 
A BPSC is a commercial off-the-shelf sensor that is inexpensive, 
simple to modify, durable, and straightforward to use. An array 
of the barometric pressure sensor chip-based tactile sensors 
can measure multi-axial force through the reactivity of each 
sensor and detect slip by observing high frequency due to slip 
vibration, while a single barometric pressure sensor chip-based 
tactile sensor can measure pressure. Following that, we rec-
ommend the BaroTac sensing approach: Calibration matrix for 
the three-axis force measurement and the slip detection dis-
crete wavelet transform finally, we demonstrate the usefulness 
of BaroTac by mounting them on a commercial robotic grip-
per and using our sensor feedback to the direct the gripper to 
grasp common objects.

CONCLUSION
The most recent versions of the primary millon clinical inven-
tories, the millon clinical multiaxial inventory -iv and millon 
clinical multiaxial inventory -ii, have become the well-known 
instruments through multiple editions. the millon clinical mul-
tiaxial inventory, specifically in its earlier releases, and less 
significantly, the first millon clinical multiaxial inventory, has 
joined the standard of generally involved mental instruments 
in a few legal settings, however they have been met with the 
huge discussion.


