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DESCRIPTION
The philosophy of natural remedies is to stimulate the body`s 
ability to heal itself and treat the root cause of the disease. 
Natural remedies are independent general internal medicines 
that combine ancient healing traditions with scientific advanc-
es and current research. It is guided by a unique set of princi-
ples that recognize the body’s innate ability to heal, emphasize 
disease prevention, and encourage individual responsibility for 
optimal health. The naturopathic doctor (ND) strives to fully 
understand each patient’s condition and sees the symptoms as 
a physical means of communicating the underlying imbalance. 
Natural remedies are an independent primary medicine system 
that combines modern scientific knowledge with traditional 
and natural forms of medicine. The philosophy of natural reme-
dies is to stimulate the body’s ability to heal itself and treat the 
root cause of the disease. Symptoms of the disease are seen 
as warning signals for physical dysfunction and adverse habits.
Natural remedies emphasize illness as a process rather than a 
unit. Natural remedies are independent general internal med-
icines that combine ancient healing traditions with scientific 
advances and current research. It is guided by a unique set 
of principles that recognize the body’s innate ability to heal, 
emphasize disease prevention, and encourage individual re-
sponsibility for optimal health. The naturopathic doctor (ND) 
strives to fully understand each patient’s condition and sees 
the symptoms as a physical means of communicating the un-
derlying imbalance. Treatment is aimed at the patient’s under-
lying condition, not the person showing symptoms. The modal-
ity used by ND includes diet and clinical nutrition, behavioral 
transformation, hydrotherapy, homeopathy, phytomedicine, 
physiotherapy, medicines, and mild surgery. Natural remedies 
can be traced back to the practice of “natural remedies” in Eu-
rope in the 19th century, which was a system for treating ill-
nesses using natural means 2 such as water, fresh air, food, and 

herbs. .. In the early 20th century, natural remedies developed 
in the United States and Canada, combining natural remedies, 
homeopathy, spinal manipulation, and other therapies. Natu-
ropaths usually have the option of practicing in a freelance en-
vironment and working in hospitals, spas, research, healthcare, 
management, retail management, or the media. 
Non-practitioners can be found in nutrition and family coun-
selling centres as well as in beauty clinics. Specialties in infer-
tility, skin problems, sports, children, or geriatrics are possible. 
The acceptance of natural remedies is increasing around the 
world, and there is increasing movement and communication 
within the European Union. A naturopath is a health therapist 
who uses naturopathic remedies. Her / his range covers more 
than fasting, diet, water, and exercise. This includes the use 
of approved natural remedies such as homeopathy, acupunc-
ture, and herbal medicine, as well as the use of state-of-the-art 
methods such as Bioresonance, ozone therapy, and colonic hy-
drotherapy. The ability of naturopathic practitioners to use nat-
ural healing methods is crucial now that modern techniques, 
pollution, poor diet, and stress play important roles in poor 
health. Often, naturopathic physicians are the last resort pa-
tients have long sought for health. Alternative practitioners see 
people as an overall unity of body, mind, and soul by providing 
individualized care to each patient.

CONCLUSION
This offers a wealth of opportunities for professional and per-
sonal growth. Naturopathic doctors use a variety of treatments 
and focus on natural self-healing rather than specific methods. 
There are also ways to rely on unimportant “life energy fields” 
that have not been proven to exist, and there is concern that 
specialized natural remedies tend to be isolated from common 
scientific discourse. The effectiveness of naturopathic medicine 
as a whole has not been systematically evaluated and the effec-
tiveness of the individual methods used will vary.
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