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Introduction: Cataract remains the leading cause of visual im-
pairment and blindness globally despite improved delivery of 
cataract surgical services. It substantially improves visual func-
tion and enhances quality of life in affected patients. This study 
explored health-related quality of life (HRQoL) and factors as-
sociated with, two years after the cataract surgery in Armenia. 

Methods: This cross-sectional study conducted an interview-
er- administered survey among 248 patients in 2014-2015, who 
underwent cataract surgery at Sevan Lions Regional Ophthalmic 
Unit in 2012-2013. All participants underwent detailed ophthal-
mologic examination. The study tool included questions about 
socio-demographic characteristics, use of eye care services, 
comorbidities, receiving and giving social support and HRQoL. 
SF-36 tool was used to measure HRQoL. This retrospective co-
hort study enclosed information of one,632 cataract surgeries 
performed from 2007 to 2010 that was obtained from the cat-
aract written account of the Malaysian National Eye info. De-
mographic options, ocular and general comorbidites, grade of 
sawbones experience and period of surgery, sort of anaesthe-
sia, intraoperative and operative complications, and therefore 
the sort of lense were recorded. Best corrected visual acuities 
were compared before and once the operation.

Mean patient age was sixty six.9 years with equal gender dis-
tribution. the bulk of subjects had age connected cataracts. 
Phacoemulsification was done quicker than different surger-
ies, particularly by specialist surgeons. History of previous oc-
ular surgery and operations performed underneath anesthesia 
were related to larger complications. Phacoemulsification was 
related to less complications and higher visual outcomes. The 
age and etiology of cataract didn’t have an effect on compli-
cations. Malays, absence of ocular comorbidities, left eyes and 
eyes operated underneath local anaesthesia were additional 
doubtless to expertise additional visual improvement. Gender, 
age, reason behind cataract, general comorbidities and saw-
bones experience likewise as intra-and operative complications 
didn’t have an effect on the visual outcomes. Phacoemulsifica-
tion had smart visual outcomes in cataract surgery. period of 
surgery, experience of the sawbones and complications didn’t 
have an effect on the visual outcomes

Results: The mean age of participants was 72.1 (SD = 8.84), 
ranging from 47 to 90 years. Females were 52.0% of the sam-
ple. Good, borderline and poor visual outcome was identified 
in 76.6%, 14.9% and 8.5% of study participants (respectively) 
based on the WHO classification. The mean composite scores 
of SF-36among patients with good/borderline visual outcome 
and poor visual outcome were 51.1±23.6 and 45.2±25.9, re-
spectively. Gender, socioeconomic status, having at least one 
noncommunicable disease, receiving and giving instrumental 
social support (e.g., financial assistance, helping with chores 
and errands) were significantly associated with HRQoL glob-
al score in the adjusted model. The adjusted mean score of 
HRQoL was higher by 8.79 among men compared to women 
(95% CI: 0.61; 16.9). The adjusted mean score of HRQoL was 
higher by 10.9 among those who had “average and higher” so-
cio-economicstatus compared to those with “low” socio-eco-
nomic status (95% CI: 5.68; 16.2).

Conclusion: HRQoL was substantially affected by borderline 
and poor visual outcome following a cataract surgery. A focus 
on women, patients with poor socioeconomic status and with 
non-communicable diseases is warranted to improve HRQoL 
outcomes.

Note: This work is partly presented at Joint Event on 3rd Edition of International Conference on Eye and Vision & 2nd International 
Conference and Expo on Advanced Eye Care and Cataract
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