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We are delighted to announce our upcoming 10th Interna-
tional Nephrology and Urology Conference will be sched-
uled in Berlin, Germany during June 21-22, 2021which 
includes prompt keynote presentations, Oral talks, Work-
shops/Symposia, Poster presentations, and Exhibitions. 
Nephrology 2021 is the premier event that brings togeth-
er a unique and international mix of experts, researchers, 
and decision-makers both from academia and industry 
across the globe to exchange their knowledge, expertise, 
and research innovations to build a world-class Nephrolo-
gy Conference. Nephrology 2021 mainly focuses on novel 
researches, discoveries and academic processes to decorate 
gaining knowledge and exploring the recent innovations 
and discoveries in Nephrology & Urology. The targeted 
facts will be the systemic conditions that have an effect 
on the Kidneys and systemic troubles that arise because 
of urological and kidney issues. This annual conference 
highlights the theme “Meeting the Challenges and Inno-
vations in Nephrology and Urology”. This convention 
designed to offer complete platform wherein global-class 

Professors, Doctors, Scientists, Student Researchers and 
Analyst to talk about techniques for diagnosis and control 
of kidney and urological related issues. Nephrology 2021 
Conference intends to offer diverse and drift education so 
as to hold medicinal experts side by means of facet of the 
issues influencing the avoidance, finding and treatment 
of subject matter associated with Nephrology and Urol-
ogy. The key strategic objective of organizing committee 
is to communicate science and medical research between 
academia, and industry. From planning to coordinating, 
start to finish; we will be there to ensure you take the ac-
colades for yet another brilliant program. 
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