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Autoimmune pancreatitis has received 
increased attention from clinical and basic 
researchers in the last few years because it is a 
field of chronic benign pancreatic diseases in 
which notable advances have been made. The 
number of cases of this disease which have 
been diagnosed has increased in the past few 
years [1, 2]. Recently, a new paper has been 
published by French authors whose efforts 
were addressed towards evaluating the 
presence of autoimmune pancreatitis in 
patients with so-called “idiopathic” 
pancreatitis [3]. The aim of this study was to 
identify autoimmune stigmata in the three 
forms of idiopathic chronic pancreatitis: 
pseudotumoral, duct-destructive and classic 
chronic pancreatitis. All patients who 
underwent exploration for idiopathic chronic 
pancreatitis were enrolled in the study. The 
data recorded were examination by an internal 
medicine specialist, autoantibody and 
immunoglobulin screening, and pancreatic 
duct imaging. The authors included 60 
patients: 11 had pseudotumoral chronic 
pancreatitis, 27 had duct-destructive disease, 
and the remaining 22 had an classic chronic 
pancreatitis. There were no significant 
differences among the three types with regard 
to sex ratio, age, frequency of episodes of 
acute pancreatitis, or obstructive jaundice. 
Pancreatic calcifications were seen only in 
81% of the cases with the classic form of 
chronic pancreatitis. Autoimmune disease was 
present in ten patients and was associated 

with ulcerative colitis in five patients, primary 
sclerosing cholangitis in two patients, and 
Sjögren's syndrome, Hashimoto's thyroiditis 
and Graves' disease in one patient each. 
Autoimmune diseases were present in 36% of 
the patients with pseudotumoral form, in 19% 
of those with duct-destructive form and in 5% 
only of those with the classic form. IG4 levels 
were increased in 2 of 6 in the pseudotumoral, 
1 of 9 in the duct-destructive, and in none of 
the 12 patients in the classic group. 
Combining clinical and biochemical 
autoimmune parameters, 40% of the patients 
had at least 1 autoimmune marker of the 
disease. What importance do the results of 
this study indicate? Clinical or biochemical 
autoimmune stigmata are present in 40% of 
European patients with idiopathic chronic 
pancreatitis and, in these patients, we need to 
search for the presence of an autoimmune 
mechanism which sustains chronic benign 
disease. 
From a therapeutic point of view, steroids are 
a well-known efficacious treatment of 
autoimmune pancreatitis, as demonstrated by 
a recent paper from Japan [4] which 
demonstrated, in two cases of autoimmune 
pancreatitis, the regression not only of the 
inflammatory infiltration but also of 
pancreatic fibrosis after a short course of oral 
steroid therapy. Furthermore, long term 
steroid treatment [5] has been demonstrated to 
be a good therapeutic approach in 21 patients 
having autoimmune pancreatitis with a rate of 
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19% of clinical recurrence of the disease. 
Other therapeutic strategies have appeared in 
recent years such as treatment with 
ursodeoxycholic acid [6]. However, we need 
to define the histological pattern of the 
disease in order to cure it. In fact, from a 
pathological point of view autoimmune 
pancreatitis is characterized by diffuse or 
focal pancreatic swelling with a narrowing of 
the pancreatic duct and/or common bile duct. 
The histological hallmark of this type of 
pancreatitis is lymphoplasmacytic infiltration, 
especially concentrated on the pancreatic 
ducts [7, 8, 9]. At present, we also have the 
possibility of classifying the various 
pathological aspects of autoimmune 
pancreatitis, such as the Mayo Clinic 
classification [10] which identified two 
histologic groups: lymphoplasmacytic 
sclerosing pancreatitis and idiopathic duct-
centric chronic pancreatitis. The latter 
classification comes from Europe [11]. These 
authors found that granulocytic epithelial 
lesions predominantly occur in a subset of 
patients who are younger, more commonly 
have ulcerative colitis and Crohn's disease, 
and seem to have fewer recurrences than 
patients without granulocytic epithelial 
lesions. Another important finding of this 
paper is that  pancreatic biopsy material is 
helpful in establishing the diagnosis of 
autoimmune pancreatitis. In line with this 
previous paper is the paper from the U.S. 
[12]. In this paper, the authors identified 16 
patients with autoimmune pancreatitis, 
initially evaluated by EUS-guided FNAB, 
eleven of whom subsequently underwent a 
pancreaticoduodenectomy. They compared 
this group of patients to a cohort of EUS-
guided aspirates from 16 patients with ductal 
carcinoma of the pancreas and 19 patients 
with chronic pancreatitis. In all 51 cases, they 
semiquantitatively evaluated presence and 
atypia of ductal cells, presence and cellularity 
of stromal fragments, and inflammatory cells, 
type and distribution. Fifty percent of the 
autoimmune cases presented as obstructive 
jaundice. EUS and CT scan showed mass 
lesions in 10 and 6 cases, respectively. There 
were three false-positive cytologic diagnoses, 

an adenocarcinoma, a solid-pseudopapillary 
tumor and a mucinous neoplasm. Ductal 
epithelium was inconspicuous and was seen 
in 6 cases. The FNAB samples showed 
background lymphocytes in three 
autoimmune cases and this feature was absent 
in the control cohort. Stromal fragments with 
embedded lymphocytes were seen in 37.5% 
of autoimmune cases, in only 12.5% of the 
patients with adenocarcinoma and in none of 
those with pancreatitis. The cellularity of 
stromal fragments was significantly higher in 
autoimmune pancreatitis than in the control 
group. The main finding of this study is that 
the presence of stromal fragments of high 
cellularity with a lymphoid infiltrate in 
conjunction with clinical and radiological 
findings could potentially both establish the 
diagnosis of autoimmune pancreatitis and 
exclude the presence of a carcinoma, thus 
preventing pancreatic resection and rendering 
a specific medical treatment of patients with 
autoimmune disease possible. 
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